HOW TO LOCATE A SOLICITATION IN eMARKETPLACE

All Commonwealth agency bidding opportunities for materials and services with an estimated cost over
$10,000 are published at the Department of General Services (DGS) eMarketplace website.

There are two ways to Locate a Solicitation. The first is through eMarketplace, which is accessible to
the general public. The other way is through the PA Supplier Portal. The PA Supplier Portal is for
registered suppliers who must log in with their Logon ID and password in order to respond to a
solicitation. Navigation instructions for both immediately follow.

To locate current bidding opportunities, go to www.emarketplace.state.pa.us. eMarketplace is your
one-stop shop for all bidding and contract information.
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The main page of eMarketplace includes the following menu options (use your mouse to hover over the
buttons for details):

e Solicitations — Search and view current solicitations;

e Solicitation Tabulations — An overview of the suppliers and pricing for previous solicitations.
These tabulations are for information only and do not constitute an official award;

e Awards — A list of all recent awards in response to Solicitations;

e Search Contracts — Search the Commonwealth database for state contracts awarded by the PA
Department of General Services (DGS) and other agency-selected contracts;

e Sole Source Procurements — Includes all agency requests for sole source purchases of supplies
and services which require DGS approval;

e Emergency Procurement — Includes all agency requests for emergency purchases of supplies
and services which require DGS approval,;

e |TQ (Invitation to Qualify) — Provides a brief description of all the open ITQ contracts and
provides guidance on how to become qualified;

e Upcoming Procurements — A list of upcoming procurements available for the Commonwealth
agencies. Many of these procurements may not yet be advertised. Refer to the Solicitations
section for those that are available for response;

e Pennsylvania —State of Independence — Connects you to the Pennsylvania home page,
www.PA.Gov;

e Help — Provides helpful tips and guides on how to use the PA eMarketplace application.

All current advertised solicitations can be found on eMarketplace under the Solicitations tab. To locate
a solicitation, follow these steps:

A. Select the Solicitations tab:
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B. Start your solicitation search by entering the specific search criteria in one or more of the
available fields below. Then, click on Search.

Marketplace Supplier Service Center Bureau of Procurement

admin login e-mail
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All suppliers wishing to de business with the Commenwealth must register at www pasupplierportal. state pa.us.
Click the bookmark link to bookmark the page. (Intemet Explorer Only)

Enter Search Criteria
Mo fields required. The more detail you give. the fewer results will appear.

Solicitation #: l:l Agency: ‘ v‘

Solicitation Title or B
Description- ‘ County: ‘ "| [ Statewide [IMultiple

Salicitation Type: []View Small Business Reseme Procurements (SBR)

O Senice (O Service & Materials (' Agency Construction & All
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Bid Open Date (mm/dd/yyyy): |:| Solicitations Posted Since (mm/dd/yyyy): '

View Current Records &
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Search Result - Hover your mouse over the Description or Title text to get more details. (Internet Explorer Only)

No. of records per page:

Advertisement Type:

C. The search results are displayed below. You can now view a specific solicitation.

D. Click on the specific solicitation you want to review found under the Solicitation # column. This
will open the Advertisement Information page.

Search Result - Hover your mouse over the Description or Title text to get more details. {Internet Explorer

Export Search Results
Mo. of records per page: - [ E

Solicitation L . . - Amended | Solicitation | Solicitation Contact
Types| Solicitation Title Description Agenc Coun Status
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6100018100  IFB Dauph 3/18/2011 372172011 411212011 Created
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78412500000 Portakle This Reguirement 4412011 Jennifer
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Psp Hamburg Station Furnish All Labor . 482011 Kathlesn
6100018063  IFB State Pol Berks 21712011 21812011 41602011 Ope:
Lawn Care Matesials And E ... = 1:35:00 PM Kulp




ADVERTISEMENT INFORMATION

General Information Help
Department for this solicitation: Procurement

Date Prepared: 03/15/11 Type(s): IFB

Advertisement Type: Senice

Solicitation #: 6100018075 Solicitation Title: Fire Alarm Inspect/Maintenance

Description:

Test & inspect the Motifier Fire Alarm System at SCI Forest, Marienville, PA 16239; three year contract starting July 11, 2011 to June 30, 2014
Department Information

Department/Agency: Corrections

Delivery Location: (limit of 300 characters) Sci Forest 286 Woodland Drive Marienville Pa 16239

County (if applicable):

Duration: 3 years, 7/1/11 to 6/30/14

Contact Information
First Name: Nancy  Last Name: Keller

Phone Number: 814-621-2110 Ext: 1109 Email: nkeller@state_pa.us
Solicitation Information

Solicitation Start Date: 03/18/11 Solicitation End Date: 04/06/11

Opening Date: 04/06/11 Opening Time: 1:00 PM

Opening Location: Sci Forest 286 Woodland Drive Marienville Pa 16239
No. of Addendums: (# of versions)

You must go to www_pasupplierportal. state pa.us to complete this bid.
Amended Date: 03/15/11

Print Advertisement Retum To Search

Go to Solicitation Tabulations No Tabulations exist for 6100018075.
Go to Awards No Awards exist for 6100018075.

Go to Contracts No Contracts exist for 6100018075.

The Advertisement Information page provides a general overview of the solicitation. It will also tell you
if the solicitation is electronic. If electronic, it must be completed in the PA Supplier Portal (instructions

immediately follow on next page).

If you need further help, please contact the Customer Service Center
by dialing toll-free (877) 435-7363 and select Option 2.



HOW TO LOCATE A SOLICITATION IN THE PA SUPPLIER PORTAL

Open your web browser and enter www.pasupplierportal.state.pa.us.

\ A. Select the Supplier Logon button.

nennculvania™Y  welrnme PA Suppliers

SUPPLIER LOGON »
—
Supplier Registration
[4]®] 4
I Detailed Navigation =]
- PA Supplier Portal Home Welcome to the Pennsylvania Supplier Portal!
= New Supplier Registration
= Supplier Service Center

IMPORTANT SYSTEM NOTI{

Registrations will only be processed during)|
hours.

If you are experiencing access problems with this site
availability information.

B. Enter the Logon ID and Password you created when you registered as a supplier, and click the
Log In button. The PA Supplier Portal Welcome Screen will then display.

Log In
If you are experiencing access problems

with this site, please select status for
system availability information.

| Logon 10 -
| Password -
wET|

Logon Problems? Reset Password

Passwords require: a minimum of 7 characters,
including 1 Special Character (pressing shift and a
number key simultaneously, e.g. %, ™, &),

1 Uppercase Letter, 1 Lowercase Letter, and 1
Mumber.



http://www.pasupplierportal.state.pa.us/�

C. If you have been assigned both the Administrator and Bidder roles for your organization, the
Vendor Administrator tab will be selected by default. Select the Bidder tab to proceed.

- A window box will appear asking permission to display non-secure items: Yes or No. Click
IlYeS.”

D. To begin your search for solicitations, select the Search/Submit a Bid link in the left navigation
panel.

[4]¥] 1

I Detailed Navigation =
WELCOME BIDDER

r Welcome Bidder
Search/Submit a Bid

As a Company Bidder in the PA Supplier Portal you have the authority to electronically view and respond
« Enterprize Applications

to Commonwealth Solicitations. Please refer to the "Search/Submit a Bid" link on the left navigational
= Supplier Service Center bar to:

s View current solicitations
« Respond to solicitations
« Manage responses to solicitations

The "Supplier Service Center" link located on the left navigation bar contains helpful tools to provide
assistance throughout the Bidding Process. To explore Commonwealth Solicitations and view Recent
Awards visit PA eMarketplace available via the Supplier Service Center.

The "Help" link located on the upper right corner contains common supplier questions and contact
information.

E. The Process Bids screen will display. It contains search fields to assist you in locating
solicitations.

- When the Bid Document number is known, enter it into the Number of Document field and
select the Start button to initiate the search.

- When the Bid Document number is not known, select the drop-down list in the Status field
and choose one of the available options. Then select the Start button to initiate the search.

SearchiSubmit a Bid

| History, Back Fo
[4]¥] |
| _pstaited navigation =] Process Bids
= Welcome Bidder Find Bid Invitations and Auctions
= SearchiSubmit a Bid Number of Document Mame tatus Processed by Me
= Enterprise Applications ‘ ‘ ‘ " 3
= Supplier Service Center
Start 'ilended Search
Tip: Choose a symbol in the Action column or view the solicitation by choosing the solicitation number. Check status and if “Held™ select “Change” to continue bid submission process.
Search Result: 152 Hits
Number Name Trans. Type Start Date End Date Bid Status Action
6100018165 2111, Dictation System Med. Rec. Invitation For Bid 03/23/2011 15:00:00 03/30/2011 09:00:00 No Bid Created ®, m
6100018160 21 Motodrives FY10 Fixed Assels Invitation For Bid 03/23/2011 14:00:00 04/07/2011 14:00:00 No Bid Created *, |
6100018154 75 SERVER, FRED SR 3/22/11 CS Invitation For Bid 03/23/2011 12:00:00 03/30/2011 17:00:00 No Bid Created *, o
6100018148 2510 20 PSP 10220 EXEC SVCS CHV TRAVERSE Invitation For Bid 03/21/2011 15:00:00 03/28/2011 13:30:00 No Bid Created A, G g
6100018147 1153 SEWAGE PLANT BLOWER SERVICE LH Invitation For Bid 03/21/2011 17.00:00 04/11/2011 13:00:00 Ne Bid Created A ﬂ fug
6100018145 1188-27715 UPS BATTERIES 03/21/2011 Invitation For Bid 03/22/2011 12:00:00 04/06/2011 09:00:00 No Bid Created *, ﬂ g
6100018143 7844610ED,Services, Janitorial Invitation For Bid 03/22/2011 15:00:00 04/11/2011 10:00:00 No Bid Created #, ﬂ g
6100018138 2111, WeSH-Med Carts. Invitation For Bid 03/22/2011 08:00:00 03/28/2011 09:00:00 No Bid Created o, G |
6100018136 20 PSP Transportation Div Lawn Care Invitation For Bid 03/23/2011 14:30:00 04/13/2011 13:30:00 No Bid Created *, w




A list of search results will display by using any search method.

The Display icon Q oispiay 5 displays basic data and detailed information of the selected
solicitation, as well as the bidder’s response after it is created.

- The Bid Document number is a link. When selected, it will open the solicitation for viewing.

i';%? Change Bid

- The Change or Edit icon allows the bidder to change information on a

previously held or submitted bid to be changed by the bidder.

- The Create icon [] create Bia allows the bidder to create a bid response on behalf of their
company on any open solicitation.

Delete Bid

The Trash or Delete icon is used by the bidder to delete a bid response.

Select the appropriate icon and proceed with your bid.
The Display Invitation for Bid screen opens for viewing.

- To exit this screen, select the Back to Initial Screen link. You will be returned to the search
results list where you may continue to look for additional bidding opportunities.

If you need further help, please contact the Customer Service Center
by dialing toll-free (877) 435-7363 and select Option 2.



HOW TO RESPOND TO A SOLICITATION

Before you respond, please carefully review the entire solicitation document and understand both the
specifications and (if applicable) any special conditions. Additionally, take careful note of the
solicitation’s End Date & Time and_Opening Date & Time.

The End Date & Time is when the solicitation officially expires. You may make changes to your
submitted bid responses until this time. The Opening Date & Time is when the solicitation responses
will be opened and evaluated. To begin the Bid Responses process, follow these directions:

A. In Search/Submit a Bid, locate the solicitation that you want to respond to.

Wendor Administrator Bidder

Search/Submit a Bid | History, Back
[4]¥] i
I Detsiled Navigation [=] Process Bids
» Welcome Bidder Find Bid Invitations and Auctions

it a Bid Number of Document Name Status Processed by Me

v

* Enterprise Applications | = I v A Area Find Bid Irvitations and Aud

= Supplier Service Center
Extended Search

Tip: Choose a symbol in the Action column or view the solicitation by choosing the solicitation number. Check status and if *Held” select “Change” to continue bid submission process.

Search Result: 152 Hits

Number Name Trans. Type Start Date End Date Bid Status Action
6100018165 2111, Dictation System Med. Rec. Invitation For Bid 03/23/2011 15:00:00 03/30/2011 09:00:00 No Bid Created R, g[
6100018160 21 Wotodrives Fy 10 Fixed Assets Invitation For Bid 03/23/2011 14:00:00 04/07/2011 14:00:00 No Bid Created R, g[
6100018154 75 SERVER, FRED SR 3/22/111 CS Invitation For Bid 03/23/2011 12:00:00 03/30/2011 17:00:00 No Bid Created &, g[
B. Select the Create icon for the solicitation that you want to respond to.

C. The Process Bid screen will display (below).

Pr Bid

Submit | | Hold Check| | Refresh | | Output Preview Back to Initial Screen

Invitation For Bid: Name 1153 SEWAGE PLANT BLOWER SERVICE LH Number 6100018147 External Version Number 1

et

TIPS: 1. SELECT THE CHECK BUTTON AND THEN SCROLL TO THE BOTTOM OF THE SCREEN FOR REQUIRED ACTIONS. 2. Enter item price in numeric format without a dollar sign. 3.
Enter item per unit of meazure in numeric format (i.e., Per 1). 4. Users must rezpond to Attributes by =electing the "General Data™ tab = "Aftributes™.

D Display Documents

item Overview

* Find ltem

ftem Description ltem Category Product Category Sau:;ln:;‘d ’::E::m‘)s (bu:netﬁsme) Price Required  Action
1 Other Utilty Services  Material FACLITES MANAGEMEN 2000 Each erg  1ig |usp Per | | on &
2 Otner Utilty Services  Material FACLITES MANAGEMEN 50000 Each org  tig |usp per | |lon b
3 Other Utilty Services  Material FACLITES MANAGEMEN 5.000 Each erg  1ig |usp Per | | on &
4 Other Utilty Services  Material FACLITES MANAGEMEN 2000 Each org  tig |usp per | |lon b
5 Otner Utilty Services  Material FACLITES MANAGEMEN  50.000 Each org  1ig |usp Per | | on &
& Other Utilty Services  Material FACILITES MANAGEMEN 5.000 Each [N 1ig | |usp Per | |/on &5

Legend : Q Display item details @ Change price




D. On the General Data tab, complete the Attributes sub-tab.

E. Attributes are a series of questions that require a response. Read each question carefully.
Select the drop-down button in the Reply field and choose your response from the list.

- Where directed, enter any additional information associated with the question into the
comment field. If you do not reply to every Mandatory Attribute Question, you will receive
an error message when submitting your Bid Response.

[ e

Basic Data || Attributes || Information from Purchaser | My Notes | PadnenDelivery Address | Conditiens | Bid Invitation Wersions

Check the information in your bid. You can alzo add your own notes.
TIPS: 1. SELECT THE CHECK BUTTON AND THEM SCROLL TO THE BOTTOM OF THE SCREEN FOR REQUIRED ACTIONS. 2. Enter item price in numeric format without a dollar =ign. 3.
Enter tem per unit of measure in numeric format (i.e., Per 1). 4. Users must respond to Aftributes by selecting the "General Data” tab = "Attributes™.
Overview of Attributes
Question Reply Comment

1. HAS THE SUBMITTER READ, AND DOES THE SUBMIMTER UNDERSTAND, THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THIS
SOLICTATION?

2|5 THE OFFER IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THIS SOLICITATION? *

3. D0 ALL MEMS OFFERED BY SUBMITTER CONFORM TO THE SPECIFICATIONS OF THIS SOLICITATION?
4 WERE THE PRICE(S) AND AMOUNT ARRMED AT INDEPENDENTLY AND WITHOUT CONSULTATION,
COMMUNICATION OR AGREEMENT WITH ANY OTHER CONTRACTOR, SUBMITTER OR POTENTIAL SUBMITTER? *

5. WERE THE PRICE(S), AMOUNT, APPROXIMATE PRICE(S) OR THE APPROXIMATE AMOUNT DISCLOSED TO ANY FIRM
OR PERSON WHO IS A SUBMITTER OR POTENTIAL SUBMTTER? *

6. WAS AN ATTEMPT MADE TO INDUCE ANY FIRM OR PERSON TO REFRAIN FROM RESPONDING TO THE
SOLICTATION? =

7. WAS AN ATTEMPT MADE TO INDUCE ANY FIRKM OR PERSON TO SUBMIT AN OFFER HIGHER THAN THE
SUBMMTER'S OFFER? *

8. WAS AN ATTEMPT MADE TO INDUCE AMY FIRM OR PERSON TO SUBMIT ANY OTHER FORM OF COMPLEMENTARY
OFFER? *

5. DID THE SUBMITTER MAKE THE OFFER IN GOOD FAITH? *

10. 15 A GOVERNMENTAL AGENCY INVESTIGATING THE SUBMITTER, ITS AFFILIATES, SUBSIDIARIES, OFFICERS,
DIRECTORS OR EMPLOYEES? IF YES, PROVIDE EXPLANATION IN COMMENT FIELD OR AS AN ATTACHMENT. =




F. Click to complete the Information from Purchaser sub-tab.

lem Data

Basic Data | Attributes ||Information from Purchaser | My Notes | Partner/Delivery Address | Conditions | Bid Invitation Versions

Check the information in your bid. You can also add your own notes.

TIPS: 1. SELECT THE CHECK BUTTON AND THEN SCROLL TO THE BOTTOM OF THE SCREEN FOR REQUIRED ACTIONS. 2. Enter item price in numeric format without a dollar sign. 3.
Enter item per unit of measure in numeric format (ie., Per 1). 4. Users must rezpond to Attributes by selecting the "General Data” tab = "Attributes™.

Texts

To Display / Edit the Texts, Choose the Appropriate Text Type

Text Overview
Text Type Text Preview (60 Chars.)
Tendering text ANTICIPATED ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT IS 7/1/11 THROUGH &/30...

Purchaser's Remarks

UETE TR ANTICTPATED ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT 1S 7/1/11 THROUGH 6/30/13 ~
PLEASE SEE ATTACHED WORK STATEMENT FOR BLOWER SERVICES.
PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SECURITY FROCEDURES FOR CONIRACTORS.
STANDARD TERMS & CONDITICNS ARE INCORPORATED IN THE BID DOCUMENT.
"THIS BID MUST BE RETURNED BY EAFER”
"BID RESULTS WILL BE POSTED TO THE DG5S E MARRKET PLACE WEBSIIE
{www.enarketplace.state.pa.us) UNDER SOLICITATICON TABULATICNS ON
THE DAY FOLLOWING THE BID OPENING. BID TAES LARE FCR INFCRMATIONAL ~

Attachments

Overview of Attachments

Description Category Version Processor Typ File Size (Kb) Changed By Changed on
Standard Terms and Conditions Legal Document 1 pdf 83 XIAPPLUSER = 03/21/2011 14:10:56

- Within the Information from Purchaser sub-tab, you will find information from the
Commonwealth which describes the specifications and conditions of the solicitation. The

information may be entered as text in the Tendering Text or Purchaser’s Remarks fields, as
a document attached to the solicitation.

- Open all attachments by selecting the document name link and carefully review them
before submitting your response. Many solicitations require an attachment (such as a form,
for example) which must be completed and returned with your bid response. In this case,
you must first open the document and save it to your computer desktop or another
electronic file. Then complete the document as required and re-save the document with
your updated information. To re-attach this document to the bid, you will need to go to the
My Notes sub-tab found on the next page.

10



G. Click and complete the My Notes sub-tab.

tem Data

Basic Data | Attributes | Information from Purchaser | My Notes || Partner/Delivery Address | Conditions | Bid Invitation Versions
Check the information in your bid. ¥ou can also add your own notes.

TIPS: 1. SELECT THE CHECK BUTTON AND THEM SCROLL TO THE BOTTOM OF THE SCREEN FOR REQUIRED ACTIONS. 2. Enter item price in numeric format without a dollar =ign. 3.
Enter item per unit of measure in numeric fermat (i.e., Per 1). 4. Users must respond to Attributes by selecting the "General Data” tab > "Attributes”™.

— Texts

Bidder's Remarks

— Attachments

Upload a Document:

Description
Path
Add

No Documents Available

My Notes contains two areas: Texts and Attachments.

Within Texts is Bidder’s Remarks. This allows you to type any comments or information
associated with your bid response. When entering comments in this field, be careful not to
include any statements that would conflict with the specifications or terms and conditions
of the solicitation. If this occurs, your bid response could be rejected.

The Attachments area provides the ability to attach any documents to your bid response.
Be careful not to attach anything that would indicate a change or conflict with the

specifications or terms and conditions of the solicitation. If this occurs, your bid response
could be rejected.

H. Review the Partner/Delivery Address sub-tab for any delivery address information for the
materials or services being requested for the solicitation.

P o o[ i

Basic Data | Attributes | Information from Purchaser | My Notes | Partner/Delivery Address | Conditions | Bid Invitation Versions
Check the information in your bid. You can alzo add your own notes.

TIPS: 1. SELECT THE CHECK BUTTON AND THEN SCROLL TO THE BOTTOM OF THE SCREEN FOR REQUIRED ACTIONS. 2. Enter item price in numeric format without a dollar sign. 3.
Enter item per unit of measure in numeric format (i.e., Per 1). 4. Users must rezpond to Attributes by selecting the "General Data” tab = "Aftributes”.

Partner Overview

Function Number Name Action
Ship-To Address 1 EXEC BRANCH & F W
Location 300402 CORR SCI Laurel Highlands |

11




I. Review the Conditions sub-tab for any conditions such as discounts off of gross price or
surcharges that are associated with a specific line item.

- If you respond to a bid solicitation that includes a discount off a manufacturer’s price list or
catalog, the percent discount must be entered on the Conditions screen for the associated
line item. You must also enter the percent discount that your company is offering for the
manufacturer’s price list or catalog in the Amount column.

\

e X

Basic Data | Attributes | Information from Purchaser | My Notes | Partner/Delivery Address || Conditions || Bid Invitation \Versions

Check the information in your bid. You can also add your own notes.
TIPS: 1. SELECT THE CHECK BUTTON AND THEN SCROLL TO THE BOTTOM OF THE SCREEN FOR REQUIRED ACTIONS. 2. Enter item price in numeric format without a dollar sign. 3.
Enter item per unit of measure in numeric format (i.e., Per 1). 4. Uzers must respond to Attributes by selecting the "General Data” tab = "Attributes”.

Overview of Conditions.

Condit. Type Amount Price Unit Unit Walid From Walid To Actions
T

Add New Conditions:

12




J.  After selecting the Item Data tab, you will be defaulted to the Iltem Overview screen. This

screen displays basic information about each of the line items in the bid solicitation.

}

owansa) [

TIPS: 1. SELECT THE CHECK BUTTON AND THEN SCROLL TO THE BOTTOM OF THE SCREEN FOR REQUIRED ACTIONS. 2. Enter item price in numeric format without a dollar sign. 3.
Enter item per unit of measure in numeric format (i.e., Per 1). 4. Users must respond to Attributes by selecting the "General Data” tab » "Attributes”.

D Dizplay Documents

FT em

ttem De=cription
1 Other Utility Services
2 Other Utility Services
3 Other Utility Services
4 Other Utility Services
5 Other Utility Services

& Other Utilty Services

ftem Category
Waterial
Waterial
Iaterial
Material
Material

Material

Product Category
FACILITIES MANAGEMEN
FACILITIES MANAGEMEN
FACILITIES MANAGEMEN
FACILITIES MANAGEMEN
FACILITIES MANAGEMEN

FACILITES MANAGEMEN

Submitted  Attachments

Quantity (buyer/me)

2.000 Each [
50.000 Each [
5.000 Each [
2.000 Each [
50.000 Each [
5.000 Each o0ra

Notes
(buyerime)

170

170

Price Required  Action
| USD Per | | on &
| USD Per | | on @
| usD per | | on @4 5
| usD per | | on @5
| UsD Per | | on & 5
| USD Per | | on &

13




st ]

Basic Data|| Schedule Lings | Information from Purchaser | My Notes | Conditions | Pardtner/Delivery Address ¢ Back Continue : Back to tem Overview

Item Detail 1: Other Utility Services

tem Category Material

Vendor Product Number

Manufacturer [

Manufacturer Part Number [}
Product Category FACILITIES MANAGEMEN

Submitted Quantity 2.000 Each

Price United States Dollar Per Each
Delivery Time (Duration) Days

Required at 00:00:00

Incoterm [

Origin Acceptance O

Qrigin Acc. in Bid Invitation

Guaranteed Minimum Amount 0.00

- Vendor’s Product Number: If applicable, enter your company’s product number in this
field.

- Manufacturer: If your product is produced by a manufacturer, you may enter it in this field.
You may also perform a search for the manufacturer by selecting the Find icon.

- Manufacturer Part Number: If the manufacturer’s part number is different than your
company’s part number, enter it in this field.

- Price: Enter your company’s price in this field.

- Per and Target Value Bid: These two fields are to remain blank. The Per field defaults as
per the solicitation.

- Delivery Time (Duration): Enter your estimated lead time for delivery in this field. Notice
that the Duration (days, weeks) defaults into the bid response based upon what was

entered in the solicitation.

- Incoterm: Review this field to ensure that it displays FOB Destination as the delivery term.
If it does not, select the Find icon and correct it by selecting the FOB from the results page.

- Origin Acceptance: This field is to remain blank.

If the bid solicitation contains more than one line item, repeat the steps described to complete
each line item.

14



K. The remaining sub-tabs on the Item Data tab are very similar to those on the Basic Data tab,
and should be completed accordingly for the applicable line item.

comttna

Jr—

Basic Data| | Fchedule Linez | Information from Purchaser | My Notes | Conditions | Partner/Delivery Address « Back Continue ; Back to kem Overviey

Item Detail 4: Other Utilty Services

ltern Category Material

Wendor Product Number

Manufacturer (]

Manufacturer Part Number iy
Product Category FACILITES MANAGEMEN

Submitted Cuantity 2.000 Each

Price United States Dollar Per Each
Delivery Time (Duration) Days

Required at 00:00:00

Incoterm o

Origin Acceptance i

Origin Acc. in Bid Invitation

Guaranteed Minimum Amount 0.00

- Schedule Lines: This sub-tab relates to delivery schedules, and should only be
addressed if applicable.

General Data ()
Basic Data § | Schedule Lines | Information from Purchaser | My Notes | Conditions | Partner/Delivery Address ¢ Back Continue » Back to tem Overview
Item Detail 1: Other Utility Services
Schedule Lines
tem Number Quantity Unit of Measure Delivery Date Action
1 EA
2 EA
3 EA
4 E&
5 EA
6 EA 7]
7 EA
8 EA
9 EA
10 EA
11 EA
12 EA ig
13 EA i
Total Quantity: 0.000 EA « (1-13From13 » »
[Add New Schedule Lines | [ Delete All Schedule Lines | [ Generate Schedule Lines
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- Information from Purchaser: This sub-tab should contain details and attachments specific
to that particular line item. Review and address any instruction, as necessary.

General Data (1)

Basic Data | Schedule Lines ||information from Purchazer |Mg Notes | Conditions | Partner/Delivery Address «Back Continue » Back to kem Overview

Item Detail 1: Other Utility Services
Texts

To Display / Edit the Texts, Choose the Appropriate Text Type

Text Overview
Text Type Text Preview (60 Chars.)
Tendering text PREWENTATIVE MAINTENAMCE AND MAJOR OPERATING INSPECTIONS FOR...

Purchaser's Remarks

TErEEri PREVENTATIVE MAINTENANCE AND MAJOR OPERATING INSPECTIONS FOR
SEWAGE PLANT BLOWERS LOCATED AT THE STATE CORRECTIONAL INSIITUTION
AT LAUREL HIGHLANDS AS DESCRIEED IN THE ATTACHED WORK STATEMENT.
TWO PER YEAR AT SIX MONTH INTERVALS. SERVICE PERIOD 7/1/11
THROUGH &/30/12.

Attachments
No Documents Available

- My Notes: Enter any notes for the Commonwealth in the Bidders Remarks section.

Gerertoeia

Basic Data | Schedule Lines | Information from Pu rcha.serll My Notes !Cnnditiuns | Partner/Delivery Address ¢ Back Continue : Back to tem Overview

Itemn Detail 1: Other Utility Services

Texts

Attachments

Upload a Document:

Description Area Attachrments
Path
Add

No Documents Available
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- Conditions: If applicable, enter the percent discount off of a manufacturer’s price list or
catalog for the associated line item.

_ o R —
Basic Data | Schedule Lines | Information from Purchaser | My Notes Partner/Delivery Address <Back Contiue,  BackTd tem Overview

Item Detail 1: Other Utiity Services

Condit. Type Amount Price Unit Unit ‘Valid From Valid To Actions
| | 0.00 @ m
| v 0.00 W [
| v 0.00 WM
| | 0.00 @ m
| v 0.00 WM
| v 0.00 W @
| | 0.00 @ m
| v 0.00 W @
| v 0.00 [mfis]
| | 0.00 @ m

[Add New Conditions | [Insert from Clipboard | [ Delete Clipboard |

- Partner/Delivery address: Review the address delivery information.

Basic Data | Schedule Lines | Information from Purchaser | My Notes | M| Partner/Delivery Address I : Back Continue : Back to kem Overview|

Item Detail 1: Other Utility Services

Function Number Name Action
Ship-To Address 1 EXEC BRANCH & ]
Location 300402 CORR SCI Laure! Highlands & = ]

L. Select the Check button to review any resulting errors and/or messages and fix as needed.

M. Select the Submit button to submit your bid response. If you are not ready to submit, select the
Hold button.
- A message confirming your actions will display.

N. After you have submitted your bid response, you will have the option to print a copy by
selecting the Output Preview button.

Process Bid
[[=utmi] [Hoid] [ Detete [ checH] [Refresh [ Output Preview]
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0. If you do not want to respond to any additional solicitations, select the Log Off button to end
your session in the Supplier Portal.

pennsylvania@ Welcome Ms. Cindy Anderson Help | Logofi

Vendor Administrator Bidder
Bidder

Search/Submit a Bid | History, Back Forward

[4]¢]

|
I Detailed Navigation E Process Bids »
= Welcome Bidder Find Bid Invitations and Auctions
= SearchiSubmit a Bid Number of Document Name Status. Processed by Me
= Enterprise Applications | | = | | | = | | 5

= Supplier Service Center

Extended Search

[ores Find Bid Truirarione and onction

If you need further help, please contact the Customer Service Center
by dialing toll-free (877) 435-7363 and select Option 2.
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